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November 11, 2020 

Upcoming Events: 
 
Sun Nov 15 
8 & 10:30 am  
Worship 
1:00 pm Farewell 
Drive-by  
 

Wed Nov 18 
8:15 am Chapel 
 

 
 

 

Book Fair Postponed:  Due to unforeseen circumstances, the Scholastic Book Fair has 
been postponed.  We will send out the new dates for this once they have been finalized. 
 
School Update:  Many of you have probably seen/heard that Marshall Public Schools 
went to distance learning this week. Samuel is not following what they are doing, but will 
continue to be in-person for learning unless we have positive cases in our school that 
dictate we need to go to distance learning. This does mean, however, from today through 
Friday, November 27 will be parent transport days as the busses will not be running in 
the morning or after school. If you have any questions please contact Mr. Obry.  
 
"Farewell Sunday" Drive By:  Given the concerns and subsequent restrictions imposed 
due to COVID, sadly not everyone can, or is comfortable attending Pastor and Jennifer's 
last services on Sunday November 15th.  In an effort to provide everyone with equal 
opportunity to say their farewell's to Pastor and Jennifer, and also for Pastor and Jennifer 
to have the same opportunity, there will be a "Drive By Farewell" event held at the 
Samuel Lutheran parking lot from 1:00-2:00 PM on Sunday November 15th.  We plan to 
have Pastor and Jennifer hand out farewell cupcakes while saying their goodbye's to all 
that are able to attend.  We will also have a station that you can drop cards/gifts for the 
Schreiners as you drive up.   
 
Basketball: We are still working on finalizing items for basketball. Please look for 
information about upcoming open gyms and practices. If you have not received a phone 
call from Mr. Obry yet, he will be contacting you with more information as well. 
 
Parent-Teacher Conferences: Parent/Teacher Conferences for Grades K-8 will be held 
after school on Thursday and on Friday morning. There is no school on Friday. 
 
Forensics:  The meet at MLC has been cancelled.  We are working on forensics in class 
and will post videos to a google folder to be shared when ready.  
 
Thanksgiving Vacation: School will dismiss at noon on Wednesday, November 25th. 
There will be no school November 26th and 27th. Classes resume on Monday, 
November 30.  
 
 

November 
Birthdays 

 
Mrs. Knutson-14 
Callen Fischer-17 
Alyssa Rubendall-17 
Mrs. Onken-18 
Jaxxon Schultz-19 
William Krenz-20 
Derek Lee-24 
 
 

 




